RESOLUTIONS
14721

Resolution 1999- iss5

AUTHORIZING CONTRACT NO. 99137 WITH DALE'S TRUCK PARTS INC. FOR THE
SALE OF EIGHT (8) USED TRANSIT VEHICLES IN AN “AS IS” CONDITION FOR A TOTAL
SALE PRICE OF FIVE THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED EIGHT & 08/100 DOLLARS
(35,808.08).

WHEREAS, the vehicles listed in the attachment hereto have been determined to be
obsolete in accordance with the Authority’s vehicle replacement policy; and

WHEREAS, the bids of the five (5) companies as listed in said attachment for said
vehicles were received on the 12" day of November, 1999; and

"WHEREAS, the General Manager deems the bid of Dale's Truck Parts inc. to be the
highest responsive bid from a responsible bidder and recommends acceptance thereof by the
Board of Trustees. '

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Trustees of the Greater
Cleveland Regional Transit Authority, Cuyahoga County, Ohio:

Section 1. That the bid of Dale’s Truck Parts inc., whose address is P.O. Box 2,
Cedarville, OH 45314 for the purchase of eight (8) vehicles as listed on Attachment A hereto for
a total purchase price of five thousand eight hundred eight & 08/100 dollars ($5,808.08) be and
the same is hereby accepted as the highest responsive bid from a responsible bidder.

Section 2. That the General Manager of the Authorit’lﬁ( be and he is hereby authorized to
enter into a contract with Dale’s Truck Parts Inc. for the sale of said transit vehicles as
described on such terms as are in the interest of the Authority.

Section 3. That proceeds of said sale in the amount of five thousand eight hundred eight
& 08/100 dollars ($5,808.08) be deposited into the Generai Fund.

Section 4, That this résoiution shall become effective immediately upon its adoption.

Adopted: November 23 , 1999

President /
Attest: ﬂﬂ —a i

Interim General Manaéer/Sec@
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ament A

Dale's Truck [Wooster Iron &| DeMilta Iron & - Transit Sales
Coach | Year | Make Serial Number Mileage Parts, Inc. Metai Metal N.EM.C.O. international
' 973.344 2696 )
_ IFB# 199137 800.848.3589 | 330.264.8956 | 440.946.7478 | 873.589.2253

B270 | 1982 | GMC | 1GOYT82J9CV821116 | 585,156 $ 726.01 | % 125 ¢ 27800} % 251.00 No Bid
8518 | 1985 |FLXIBLE| 1GF5AGAK3DF097129| 516,626 $ 72601 % 511271 % 279.00 | $ 251.00 No Bid
8564 | 1985 |FIXIBLE| 1GF5AGAKXDF097175! 471,597 $ 726,011 % 51127 | $ 279001/ % 251.00 No Bid
8571 | 1985 |FILXIBLE| 1GFSAGAK7DF097182| 472,049 $ 72601 | % 51127 1 % 279001 % 251.00 No Bid
8578 | 1985 |FLXIBLE| 1GF5AGAKXDF097189{ 470,257 $ 726011 % 511271 % 27900 % - 25100 No Bid
8583 | 1985 |FLXIBLE| 1GF5AGAK3DF097194 | 467,028 $ 726.01 | $ 51127 | % 27900 % 251.00 No Bid
8593 1 1985 | FLXIBLE| 1GF5AGAK2DF097204| 390,924 $ 72601 | % 511271 % 279001 $  251.00 No Bid
8595 ; 1985 |FLXIBLE| 1GFSAGAK6DF097206] 434,718 $ 726.01 | % 511271 % 27900 ; $ 251.00 No Bid
L Total $ 5,808.08 % - $ - $ - $ -
Deposit | $ 1,16162 | $ 45000 | $ 45000 % 716.03 | % . -

B Balance | $ 4,646.46 |-$ 450.00 |-$ 450.00 (-$ 71603 (% -

# Vehicles 8 0 0 0 0
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