
RESOLUTION NO. 1999- 74 

AUTHORIZING CONTRACTS NO. 99056A THROUGH 99056H WITH TWO INDIVIDUALS 
AND SIX COMPANIES FOR THE SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS AND EQUIPMENT IN 
"AS IS" CONDITION FOR A TOTAL PRICE OF $15,359.10 

WHEREAS, the miscellaneous parts and equipment listed in the Attachment hereto have been 
determined to be obsolete and/or in such a state of disrepair that it would not be to the Authority’s 
advantage to have them repaired; and 

WHEREAS, the bids of two individuals and six companies as listed in said Attachment for said 
miscellaneous parts and equipment were received on the 19th day of May, 1999; and 

WHEREAS, the General Manager deems the bids of herein named individuals and companies 
to be the highest responsive bids from responsible bidders and recommends acceptance thereof by 
the Board of Trustees. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Trustees of the Greater Cleveland 
Regional Transit Authority, Cuyahoga County, Ohio: 

Section 1. That the bid of Willis Parsons, 4595 Boneta Road, Medina, OH, 44256 for the 
purchase of a portion of Item #1 and Item #44 as listed on the Attachment hereto for a total price of 
eight hundred and 00/00 dollars ($800.00) be and the same is hereby accepted as a responsive bid 
from a responsible bidder. 

Section 2. That the bid of BODA Industries, Inc., 238 South Main Street, South Hackensack, 
N J, 07606 for the purchase of Items # 41, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 
63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 74, 75, 76, 79, 80, and 81, for a total price of one thousand thirty- 
three and 10/100 dollars ($1,033.10i be and the same is hereby accepted as a responsive bid from a 
responsible bidder. 

Section 3. That the bid of Allied Lift truck, Inc., 3071 W. 46th Street, Cleveland, OH, 44102 for 
the purchase of Item #3 for a price of three hundred and 00/100 ($300.00) be and the same is hereby 
accepted as a responsive bid from a responsible bidder. 

Section 4. That the bid of Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc., 9932 Prospect Ave, 
Building 142, Santee, CA, 92017 for the purchase of Items #38 and #40 for a total price of two 
hundred one and 00/00 dollars ($201.00) be and the same is hereby accepted as a responsive bid 
from a responsible bidder. 

Section 5. That the bid of M. Zavodny Co., Inc., 5806 Grand Ave., Western Springs, IL, 
60558 for the purchase of Item #42 for a price of five hundred fifty-five and 00/100 dollars ($555.00) 
be and the same is hereby accepted as a responsive bid from a responsible bidder. 

Section 6. That the bid of Complete Coach Works, 1863 Service Court, Riverside, CA, 92507 
for the purchase of Items #4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 
25, 26, 39, 45, 46, 47, 72, 73, 77, and 78 for a total price of eleven thousand eight hundred and 
00/100 dollars ($11,800.00) be and the same is hereby accepted as a responsive bid from a 
responsible bidder. 
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Section 7. That the bid of Demilta Iron and Metal, 3911 Ben Hut Avenue, Willoughby, OH, 
44094 for the purchase of Items # 27, 28, 29, 30, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, and 43 for a total price of six 
hundred twenty-eight and 00/100 dollars ($628.00) be and the same is hereby accepted as a 
responsive bid from a responsible bidder. 

Section 8. That the bid of David Grinn, 845 Rosewood Dr., Brunswick, OH, 44212 for the 
purchase of Items #31, 83, 88, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, and #97 for a total price of forty-two and 00/100 
dollars ($42.00) be and the same is hereby accepted as a responsive bid from a responsible bidder. 

Section 9. That the General Manager of the Authority be and he is hereby authorized to enter 
into contracts with the two individuals and six companies listed for the sale of said miscellaneous 
parts and equipment as described on such terms as are in the interest of the Authority. 

Section 10. That the proceeds of said sale in the amount of fifteen thousand three hundred 
fifty-nine and 10/100 dollars ($15,359.10) be deposited into the General Fund. 

Section 11. That this resolution shall become effective immediately upon its adoption. 

Attachment A: IFB #99056 Bid Tabulation 

Adopted: 5une 22 

! Pre~dent 

Attest: 
,cretary-Treasurer 



IFB # 99056 - Attachment A - Bid Tabulation 

2 

3 

4 102 

5 103 

6 104 

7 105 

8 106 

9 107 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB # 99096 

Used Railroad ties (in lots of 100 ties) (10,000 ties available) 

Bid price per lot $25.00 X Number of lots 20 = 

1984 Yale Narrow Isle High Reach Lift Truck (36 Volt) 

(Note Item #2 removed from the IFB) 

Barrel C~usher (55 gallon barrel) (RTA tag # 0100347) 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

Model # Serial # 

BODA 

05110199 

10:26 AM 

Allied Lift 

9:15AM 

HECS 

10;O5 AM 

Zavodny 

10:05AM 

ccw DeMilta 

$    500.00 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$ 100.00 

$ 300,00 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$ 20.00 

$ 20.00 

No bid No bid No bid 202.00 $ 400.00 $ 41.00 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$ 51.00 $ 

$ 51.00 $ 

$ 51.00 $ 

$ 51.00 $ 

$ 51.00 $ 

$ 51.00 $ 

No bid 

202.00 

202.00 

202.00 

202.00 

202.00 

No bid 

$ 400.00 

$ 400.00 

$ 400.00 

$ 400.00 

$    400.00 

No bid 

Totalbid 

$394401 

DC2641 

V-730 NSN 

Vo730 520002188 

V-730 NSN 

V-730 510026709 

V-730 510030007 

V-730 510030050 

V-730 510032539 

V-730 510011725 

V-730 8766 

V-730 510011673 

V-730 510032508 

V-730 NSN 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid No bid No bid 

41.00 

41.00 $ 

41.00 $ 

41.00 $ 

Ghnn 

No bid 

$ 48.50 

$ 128.00 

$ 17100 

$ 12.00 

14.00 

10.00 

11.00 

8.00 

Page 



IFB # 99056 - Attachment A - Bid Tabulation 

Line Skid 

10 108 

13 111 

15 113 

16 114 

17 115 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB # 99056 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

Model # Serial # 

V-730 510029853 

V-730 510006919 

V-730 NSN 

V-730 510011819 

V-730 520007571 

V-730 510032545 

V-730 NSN 

V-730 510032345 

510029959 

510032339 

V-730 510011595 

V-730" 510030066 

V-730 6263 

V-730 510030006 

V-730 510032609 

V-730 510011848 

W. Parsons 

05/19/99 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

BODA 

05118199 

10:26 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

Allied Lift 

9:15 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

HECS 

10:05 AM 

$     51.00 

$     51.00 

$     51.00 

$     51.00 

$     51.00 

$     51.00 

$     51.00 

$     51.00 

Zavodny 

05/19/99 

10:05 AM 

$ 202.00 

$    202.00 

$    202.00 

$    202.00 

$    202.00 

$    202.00 

$    202.00 

$    202.00 

ccw 

$ 400.00 

$ 400,00 

$ 400.00 

$ 400.00 

$ 400,00 

$ 400.00 

$ 400,00 

$ 400.00 

DeMilta 

05/19/99 

41.00 $ 

41.00 

41.00 $ 

41.00 $ 

41,00 $ 

41.00 $ 

4100 $ 

41.00 $ 

Grinn 

11.00 

11.00 

13.00 

12.00 

11.0o 

11.00 

12.00 

Pag~ 



IFB # 99056 - Attachment A - Bid Tabulation 

Line Skid 

18 116 

19 117 

20 118 

21 119 

22 201 

23 202 

i24 203 

i25 204 

25 205 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB#99056 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(2) Allison Transmissions 

(4) 1982 RTS Lower Control Arm 

(4) 1982 RTS Lower Control Arm 

(4) 1982 RTS Lower Control Arm 

(3) 1982 RTS Lower Control Arm 

(4) 1982 RTS Lower Control Arm 

(4) 1982 RTS Lower Control Arm 

(4) 1982 RTS Lower Control Arm 

(4) 1982 RTS Lower Control Arm 

(5) Shepard power steering gear boxes 

Model # 

V-730 

V-730 

V-730 

V-730 

V-730 

V-730 

Vo730 

V-730 

1982 RTS 

1982 RTS 

1982 RTS 

1982 RTS 

1982 RTS 

1982 RTS 

1982 RTS 

1982 RTS 

RT$ 

Serial # 

51003001: 

510011855 

510023216 

510011475 

510032387 

510032396 

510011446 

5398 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

BODA 

05/18/99 

10:26 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

Allied Lift 

9:15 AM 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

HECS 

10:05 AM 

$ 51.00 

$ 51.00 

$ 51.00 

$ 51.00 

NO bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

$     40.00 

Zavodny 

10:05 AM 

$    202.00 

$ 202.00 

$ 202.00 

$ 202.00 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

CCW 

$ 400.00 

$ 400.00 

$ 400.00 

$ 400.00 

$ 250,00 

$ 250.00 

$ 250.00 

$ 250,00 

$ 200.00 

DeMi0a Grinn 

05/19/99 05/19/99 

$ 41.00 $ 8.00 

$ 41.00 $ 11.00 

$     41.00 $ 14.00 

$ 41.00 $ 12.00 

$ 21.00 $ 6.00 

$ 21.00 $ 4.00 

$ 21.00 $ 6.00 

$ 21.00 $ 6,0o 

$ 8.00 $ 4.00 

Pag~ 



IFB # 99056 - Attachment A - Bid Tabulation 

Line Skid 

27 206 

28 207 

29 208 

30 209 

31 210 

32 212 

33 213 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PANTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB # 99056 

(30) DDA Oil cooler housings Part # 5129421 

(19) DDA Oil cooler housings Part # 5107430 

(36) DDA Front end plate Part # 5132422 

(20) DDA Rear end plate Part # 5102841 

(2) Cummins L10 engine blocks Part # 3803717 

(2) Cummins L10 engine blocks Part # 3803717 

(2) Cummins L10 engine blocks Part # 3803717 

(32) DDA Oil cooler elbows Part # 5107422 

(14) DDA Oil cooler adapters Part # 5123392 

(35) DDA Oil cooler elbows Part # 5140360 

(30) DDA Breather adapters Part # 5130353 

(2) Detroit Diesel engine blocks Part # 5199137 

(2) Detroit Diesel engine blocks Part # 5199137 

Model # 

L10 

L10 

L10 

L10 

L10 

L10 

Serial # 

34576615 

34576066 

NSN 

34620881 

34620762 

34522711 

6V71 8VA816 

8V71 8VA811 

8V71 394757 

8V71 369679 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

BODA 

05/18/99 

10:26 AM 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

Allied Lift 

9:15 AM 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

HECS 

10:05 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$ 51.00 

Zavodny 

05/19/99 

10:05 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

CCW 

No bid    $ 

No bid     $ 

No bid $ 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

DeMiga Grinn 

05/19/99 05/19/99 

60,00 $ 6.50 

52.00 $ 15.00 

52.00 $ 28.00 

$ 52.00 $ 28.00 

$ 13.00 $ 15.00 

$ 52.00 $ 30,00 

$ 62.00 $ 18.00 

Page 



Line Skid 

34 214 

35 215 

36 216 

37 217 

38 218 

39 219 

40 220 

41 221 

42 222 

43 223 

IFB # 99056 - Attachment A - Bid Tabulation 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB # 99056 

(2) De~oit Diesel engine blocks Part # 5199137 

(2) Detroit Diesel engine blocks Part # 5199137 

(2) Detroit Diesel engine blocks Part # 5199137 

(2) Detroit Diesel engine blocks Part # 5199137 

Cummins L-10 Partial engine assembly Part # 3803717 

(31) GMC Transmission oil coolers Pad # 2036722 

(27) DDA Engine oil coo~ers Part # 854195 

(25) DDA Engine aftercoo~ers Part # 5101152 

(94) Allison transmission 9ex coupling Part # 15503066 

(400) Detroit Diesel connecting rods Part # 5104501 

(26) Cummins L-10 crankshafts Part # 3819989 

Model # Sedal # 05/19/99 

8V71 393819 

8V71 396372 NO bid 

8"V71 394455 

8V71 394219 Nobid 

8V71 394443 

8V71 393825 NO bid 

8V71 396372 

8V71 396297 No bid 

L-10 NSN No bid 

NSN 

NSN NO bid 

6V92 NSN No bid 

V730 NSN NO bid 

6V92 NSN No bid 

L-10 NSN No bid 

BODA 

0:26 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$     474.50 

No bid 

No bid 

Allied Lift 

05/19/99 

9:15AM 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

HECS 

05119199 

10:05 AM 

$ 51.00 

$ 51.00 

$ 51,00 

$ 51.00 

$ 150.00 

$ 5t.0o 

$ 51.00 

$ 51.00 

$ 51.00 

No bid 

Zavodny 

05/19/99 

10:05 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$ 555,00 

No bid 

CCW 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

$     2,000.00 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

DeMilta 

05/19/99 

Grinn 

82.00 $ 18.00 

$ 52.00 $ 17.50 

$ 52.00 $ 12.50 

$ 52.00 $ 10.50 

$ 10.00 $ 10.50 

$ 27,00 $ 32.00 

$ 3.00 $ 6.00 

$ 40.00 $ 6.00 

$ 50.00 $ 48.50 

$ 100.00 $ 78.50 

Page 



Line Skid 

44 

45 

46 

47 

48 

49 

50 

52 

53 

54 

55 

56 

IFB # 99056 - Attachment A - Bid Tabulation 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB # 99056 

Mobile office trailer 50+ foot long ("AS IS WHERE I$") 

(11) Luminator master boards 

(4) Luminator slave boards 

(8) Luminator slave boards 

(29) Vultron driver T-B 

(100) Vultron fuse panels 

(7) Vultron front display 5.5" 

(8) Vultron side display 3" 

(9) Vultron ddver T-B 

Model # 

92-20053 

92-20054 

92-20054 

92-23078 

92-23086 

92-20061 

92-23079 

92-23078 

Sedal# 05/19/99 

$    300.00 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

BODA 

05/18/99 

10:26 AM 

NO bid 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

Allied Lift 

9:15 AM 

No bid 

11.55 No bid 

4,20 No bid 

8.40 No bid 

30.45 NO bid 

t05.00 NO bid 

7.38 NO bid 

8.40 No bid 

9.45 NO bid 

HECS 

05/19/99 

IO:05AM 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

Zavodny 

05119199 

10:05 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

CCW 

No bid 

$ 200.00 

$ 50.00 

$ 100,00 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

DeMilta Grinn 

No bid No bid 

No bid $ 1.00 

No bid $ 1.00 

NO bid $ 1.00 

NO bid No bid 

NO bid No bid 

NO bid No bid 

NO bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

(25) Vultron driver T-B 

(50) Vultron regulators 

(16) Vultron regulators 

(4) Vultron ddver T-B 

92-23978 

92-23085 

92-23085 

92-23078 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$ 26.25 No bid 

$ 52,50 No bid 

$ 16.80 No bid 

$ 4.20 No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid No bid 

No bid NO bid 

No bid NO bid 

NO bid No bid 

Pagr 



IFB # 99056 - Attachment A - Bid Tabulation 

Line Skid 

57 

58 

59 

60 

62 

63 

64 

65 

66 

67 

68 

69 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB #99056 

(38) Vultron fuse panels 

(3) Vultron front display 5.5" 

Model #    Serial # 05/19/99 

92-23086 No bid 

92-20061 NO bid 

BODA 

05118199 

10:26 AM 

$ 39,90 

$ 3.15 

Allied Lift 

9:15 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

HECS 

0:05 AM 

No bid 

NO bid 

Zavodny 

10:05AM 

No bid 

No bid 

CCW 

No bid 

NO bid 

DeMilta 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

(15) Vutton 2 button monitors 

(24) Vultron memo~, boards 

(12) Vultron front DVS8000 5.5" 

(12) Vultron front DVS8000 5.5" 

(12) Vultron front DVS6000 5.5" 

(16) Vultron front DVSS000 5.5" 

92-23082 No bid 

92-23087 No bid 

92-23074-T No bid 

92-23074-T No bid 

92-23074-T No bid 

92-23074-T No bid 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

15.75 

25.20 

12.60 

16.80 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

(2) Vultron front OVS8000 5.5" 

(16) Vultron side DVS7100 3" 

(20) Vultron side DVS7100 3" 

(24) Vultron rear route 

(12) Vultron roar mute 

92-2307,~ 

92-23080-T NO bid 

92-23080-T No bid 

92-23070-T ’ No bid 

92-23070-T No bid 

No bid $ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

2.10 

16.80 

21.00 

25.20 

12:60 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

Pag~ 



IFB # 99056 - Attachment A - Bid Tabulation 

Line Skid 

70 

72 

73 

74 

75 

76 

77 

78 

79 

80 

92 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB # 99056 Model # 

(9) Vu0ron endoder box w/o memo,/boards 92-23088-T 

(28) Vultron encoder boards 92-23088 

(15) Luminator master boards 92-20055 

(6) Luminator slave boards 92-20056 

(4) Vultron front display 5.5" 92-20061 

(3) Vu0ron power supply 92-19076 

(2) Vultron encoder boards 92-19078 

(13) Luminator master boards 92-20055 

(2) Luminator slave boards 92-20056 

(10) Vultron 2 button monitors 92-23082 

(12) Vuttron driver T-B 92-23078 

(10) Vultron 2 button monitors 92-23092 

1987 Dodge B300 Cargo Van VIN # 2B7JB33T6HK221151 

Serial # 05/19/99 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

BODA 

10:26 AM 

$ 9.45 

$ 29.40 

! $ 15.75 

$ 6.30 

$ 4.20 

$ 3.t5 

$ 2.10 

$ 13,65 

$ 2,10 

$ 10.50 

$ 12.60 

$ 10.50 

NO bid 

Allied Lift 

05119199 

9:15 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

HECS 

05119199 

10:05 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

Zavodny 

10;05AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

ccw 

No bid 

No bid 

$ 600,00 

$ 50.00 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$ 450.00 

$ 50.00 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

DeMilta 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

11:48 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

$ 5.00 

Pag~ 



IFB # 99056 - Attachment A - Bid Tabulation 

83 

85 

86 

87 

90 

92 

93 

94 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB # 99056 Model # Sedal # 

Tennant Trend Servomatic-26 walk behind 8oor scrubber 

4450 Laser 1 Meg Mem printer 934581 

Pro-at-12MZ 512K 900119BE Samsung/amb/sm-12sfa sln 51 934578 

Pro-at-12MZ 512K S/N 900118BE samsungtamblsm-12SFA s 934577 

Prodata at 12MZ 512K sin 900108BE CTX 14" VGA monitor 934584 

Tape Log Recorder Cassette Re-recorder PIN 115041 ICR 908010 

Topaz power supply unit console 009205 

Work station 4 Panasonic KX-P1124 934579 

(4) 9" RCA Black and Whita closed circuit monitors 

(2) 9" Panasonic Black and White ciosod circuit monitors 

(4) D/A keypad control boxes 

(1) Coaxtron system 2000 control panel 

(9) RCA CCTV cameras 

W. Parsons 

05/19/99 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

BODA 

05118199 

10:26 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

Allied Lilt 

05/19/99 

9:15 AM 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

HECS 

05119/99 

10:05 AM 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

Zavodny 

05119/99 

10:05AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

ccw 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

DeMilta 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

Grinn 

05/19/99 

$ 5.00 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$ 1,00 

NO bid 

No bid 

$ 4.00 

$ 2.00 

$ 1.00 

$ 1.00 

$ 9.00 
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IFB # 99056 - Attachment A - Bid Tabulation 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB # 99056 

(1) 12x zoom lens for the RCA CCTV camera 

(15) 12 or 24 volt power supplies 

Model # Sedal # 

W. Parsons BODA 

11:28 AM 10:26 AM 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

Allied Lift 

9:15 AM 

No bid 

NO bid 

HECS 

10:05 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

Zavodny 

05119/99 

10:05AM 

No bid 

No bid 

ccw 

NO bid 

No bid 

DeMilta Grinn 

05/19/99 05/19/99 

NO bid    $ 

No bid    $ 2.00 

(16) DEC LN03 Printers 

(13) DEC LA210 Printers 

(21) DEC VT320 Terminals 

(4) DEC MT220 Terminals 

(4) LN05 Printers 

(9) Compaq Monitors 

(4) Compaq CPUs 

(2) Deeserver 300s 

(8) Decserver 200/DLs 

(35) Keyboards (boxed) 

(25+) Keyboards (loose) 

(I) Delni 

(2) Coax Repeaters 

(1) HP Laser Jet Series II Printer 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

NO bid No bid 

NO bid No bid 

No bid NO bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

NO bid NO bid 

NO bid NO bid 

No bid No bid 

NO bid NO bid 

NO bid No bid 

No bid NO bid 

No bid NO bid 

NO bid NO bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid NO bid 

NO bid NO bid 

NO bid No bid 
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Line Skid 

GCRTA SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS PARTS 

AND EQUIPMENT IFB # 99056 

(1) Declaser 5100 Printer 

(1) IBM Monitor 

(3) UPS Units 

(6) DEC Ethe~orks Boards 

(1) TKZ09 (Smm Tape) Drive 

(3) LN03 & 6 Memory Boards 

TOTAL AWARD 

DEPOSIT 

BALANCE 

TOTAL SALE : $15,359.10 

Model # Sedal # 

W. Parsons 

05/19/99 

No bk:l 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

$ 800.00 

$ 100.00 

$ 700.00 

BODA 

05/18/99 

10:26AM 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

. 1,033.10 

219.01 

814.09 

Allied Lift 

9:15AM 

NO bid 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

$ 300.00 

$ 80.00 

$ 220.00 

HECS 

10:05AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$ 201.00 

$ 323,60 

-$ 122.60 

Zavodny 

10:05 AM 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

555.00 

1,200,00 

645.00 

ccw 

No bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

NO bid 

No bid 

11,800.00 

2,580,00 

9,220.00 

DeMilta Grinn 

NO bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

No bid No bid 

$ 628.00 $ 42.00 

$ 328.00 $ 170.00 

$ 300.00 -$ 128.00 
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