
RESOLUTION NO. 1999-26 

AUTHORIZING CONTRACT 98166 WITH ALLSTATE TRUCK 
SALES OF EASTERN OHIO LLC FOR THE FURNISHING OF 
MOTOR COACH FILTERS AS SPECIFIED AND AS REQUIRED 
FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR IN AN AMOUNT NOTTO 
EXCEED THIRTY-ONE THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED NINETY- 
SIX & 10/100 DOLLARS ($31,896.10) - GENERAL FUND, 
INVENTORY DEPARTMENT BUDGET 

WHEREAS, the bid of Allstate Truck Sales of Eastern Ohio LLC located 327 Stone 
Creek Road N.W., New Philadelphia, OH 44663 for the furnishing of motor coach filters of 
various types, as specified and as required for a period of one (1) year was received on the 
28t~ day of January, 1999 for the unit price set forth in said bid involving an estimated 
expenditure of thirty-one thousand eight hundred ninety-six & 10/100 dollars ($31,896.10); and 

WHEREAS, the General Manager deems the offer of Allstate Truck Sales of Eastern 
Ohio LLC to be the lowest responsive bid from a responsible bidder for the items indicated on 
Attachment A hereto and recommends acceptance thereof by the Board of Trustees. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Trustees of the Greater 
Cleveland Regional Transit Authority, Cuyahoga County, Ohio: 

Section 1. That the bid of Allstate Truck Sales of Eastern Ohio LLC, for the items 
indicated on Attachment A hereto, received on January 28, 1999, for a total expenditure not to 
exceed thirty-one thousand eight hundred ninety-six & 10/100 dollars ($31,896.10) be and the 
same is hereby accepted as the lowest responsive bid from a responsible bidder .. 

Section 2. That the General Manager of the Authority be and he is hereby authorized 
to enter into a contract with Allstate Truck Sales of Eastern Ohio LLC for the furnishing of 
motor coach filters as specified and as required for a period of one (1) year. 

Section 3. That said contract shall be payable out of the General Fund, Inventory 
Department Budget in the amount not to exceed thirty-one thousand eight hundred ninety-six 
& 10/100 dollars ($31,896.10). 

Section 4. That said contract shall be binding upon and an obligation of the Authority 
contingent upon compliance by the contractor to the Specifications and Addenda, if any; the 
Affirmative Action Plan adopted by the Board of Trustees in Resolution 1996-t23; bonding and 
insurance requirements and all applicable laws relating to contractual obligations of the 
Authority.. 
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Section 5. That this resolution shall become effective immediately upon its adoption. 

Attachment: Attachment A IFB 98166 Bid Tabulation 

Adopted: March 30 

President 

A~est: 
~r 



Descrlptl~on Allstate : 

Nater Filler, 81-950 
Water Filter, 81-230OOX 

_Transmission (~il Filler, 82~13000 
Transmission O~ Filler, 81-23000V 
By-Pass Oil Filter, 81-20001 

Full Flow Oil Filter, 81-3009 

~-Filtar, 01-340C0 
~rimaP] Fuel Filter, 87-10 
Se__.condary Fuel Filter, 87-11 
Primary Fuel Filler, 87-3000 
.S.econfary Fuel Filter, 87-3001 
CNG Fuet Filter, 87-34000 

t~r Fi:ler, 87-23127 

~i~r Filter, 8_.7-23127 
~,ir Filler, 87-28";27 

~,ir Filter 87-37127 

3.48 3,96 
4.17 4,27 
7.07 6.95 
14,21 " NOBID 
7.54 , 8.17 
6.65 : 6.50 
13.66 

i 
14.58 

6.40 , 6.50 
3.05 

! 

3.07 
3.05 3.07 
5,12 -~ 4.63 
2.97 j 3.72 

¯ Bid Tabulation Sheet, IFB 9Bf86 

3.96 , 3.40 
4.09 3.79 
7.03 ; 6.59 

31.50 z 27.90 
7.39 ! 5.79 
6.34 I 5.80 
13.47 .~ t2.90 
6.C0 t 5.99 
2.90 I 2.70 
2.90 ~ 5.90 
4.66 , 7.20 
3.89 ~ 3.95 

~BOLD=Award 

t 

NO BID ~ NO BID ¯ NO BID :" "12.90 

23.23 ~ 23.23 : 22.55 ; 23.57 
27.65 ; 28.23 ~ NO BID i 24.95 
35.23 32.75 32.49 . 20.60 
22.07 : 22.04 ; 26.49 19,95 
27.67 = NO BID ~ NO BID , 37.20 

Triangle ’ UCP I Williams DD- ." 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
27,g3 

NO BID 
NO BID 
15.13 
6.88 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

3.99 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
25,40 

NO BID 

3.76 t 4.40 
3.30 4.75 
5.25 i 7.g4 
18.40 I NO BID ¯-. 
5.70 ~ 9.32 
5.82 ; 7.41 
12.45 ~ t5.56 :" 
6.50 ¯ z.41 ! - 
2.34 3.49 
2.34 3.49 
14.83 = 504 .... 
7.18 4.62 
10.75 NO BID 
4.43 " 3.08 

20.1t 25.10 
24.18 31.73 

- 24.82 36.81 
33.46 24.77 
34.09 NO BID 

Award 

Neopad 
Neopa~t 
Neopart 
AIIstale 
Neopert 
Neopart 
Neopa:t 
Neopart 
Neopa~t 
Allstate 
BTMC 

Allslata 
Neopad 

AlIstale 
i- Ne opa,’t 

Neopa,’t 
Neop~rt 
Allstate 

"J’o~al award 

Quantity 

2400 
1400 
1100 
1200 
45OO 
450O 
40 

180Q 
1500 
1500 
30 
30 

1000 
20OO 
20’3 

303 . 
2O0 
2OO 

Allstate’ 31896.10 

BTMCl 8295.90 "r 

.-,- Neopad, 1;3783.O0’ 

Amou~ 

8160.00 
5306.OO 
7249.00 
17052.00 
26055.O0 

2610O.O0 
516.00 

1078ZOO 
4050.00 
4575.00 
135.90 
89.10 

12803.e0 
8160.09 

2495.00 
6180.00 
3~90.00 
5534.00 

IFBg~" 


