
RESOLUTION NO. 1991- 70 

AUTHORIZING CONTRACTS WITH WABCO PASSENGER TRANSIT 
DIVISION FOR $6,474.50, HALL INDUSTRIES FOR 
$41,007.90 AND UNITED KNITTING MACHINE FOR $10,781.69 
FOR THE FURNISHING OF TRANSIT COUPLER PARTS AS 
REOUIRED FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR (TOTAL 
ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE $58,264.09 - GENERAL FUND) 
INVENTORY DEPARTMENT BUDGET. 

WHEREAS, the divisible bids of WABCO Passenger Transit Division 
located at P.O. Box II, Spartanburg, South Carolina 29304-0011; Hall 
Industries, Inc. located at 201 East Carson Street, Pittsburgh, 
Pennsylvania 15219 and United Knitting Machine Company, Inc. located at 
Gehman Road and Transit Way, Kulpsville, Pennsylvania 19443 for the 
furnishing of transit coupler parts, as required, was received on the 
22nd of March 1991, for the price set forth in said bids, involving a 
total estimated expenditure of fifty-eight thousand two hundred 
sixty-four & 09/I00 dollars ($58,264.09); 

WHEREAS, the General Manager deems the bid of WABCO Transit 
Division for twenty three (23) items~ Hall Industries, Inc. for 
sixty-three (63) items$ and United Knitting Machine Company, Inc. for 
nine (9) items to be the lowest and best responsive bids from responsible 
bidders and recommends acceptance thereof by the Board of Trustees. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Trustees of the 
Greater Cleveland Regional Transit Authority, Cuyahoga County, Ohio: 

Section I. That the bid of WABCO Passenger Transit Division of 
Westinghouse, the bid of Hall Industries, Inc. with WABC0 Passenger 
Transit Division of Westinghouse Air Brake (for items 8, 15, 17, 18, 28, 
29, 30, 31, 42, 43, 50, 51, 56, 81, 82, 83, 86, 87, 90, 91, 96, 125, 136) 
the bid of Hall Industries, Inc. (for items 3, 4, 5, 9, 12, 13, 22, 23, 
26, 33, 34, 36, 37, 39, 40, 44, 45, 46, 49, 58, 60~ 63~ 64, 67, 72, 73, 
74, 75, 76, 77, 78, 80, 84, 89, 99, i01, 102, 103, 104, 107, 109, Ii0, 
III, 112, 114, 115, 117, 119, 121, 123~ 124, 127, 128, 131, 134, 135, 
143, 145, 147, 149, 152, 153, 154) and the bid of United Knitting Machine 
Company, Inc. (for items 21, 24, 25, 38, 61, 126, 130, 146, 148) be and 
the same are hereby accepted as the lowest responsive divisible bids from 
responsible bidders. 

Section 2. That the General Manager of the Authority be and he 
is hereby authorized to enter into contracts with WABC0 Passenger Transit 
Division for six thousand four hundred seventy-four & 50/100 dollars 
($6,474.50), Hall Industries for forty-one thousand seven & 90/100 
dollars ($41,007.90) and United Knitting Machine Company, Inc. for ten 
thousand seven hundred eighty-one & 69/100 dollars ($10,781.69). 

Section 3. That said contract shall be payable out of the 
General Fund in a estimated total expenditure not to exceed fifty-eight 
thousand two hundred sixty-four & 09/100 dollars ($58,264.09). 
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Section 4. That said contract shall be binding upon and an 
obligation of the Authority contingent upon compliance by the contractor 
to the Bid Specifications and Addenda, if any; the Affirmative Action 
Plan adopted by the Board of Trustees in Resolution 1985-87; bonding and 
insurance requirements and all applicable laws relating to the 
contractual obligations of the Authority. 

Section 5. That this resolution shall become effective 
immediately upon its adoption. 

Adopted: April 16 , 1991 

General Manage~ary-Treasurer 

President 
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WABCO 

33.70 
1.60 
6.50 

30.00 
30.75 

142.00 
13.50 

150.00 
109.00 
45.00 
59.25 
273.00 
35.00 
33.00 
55.00 
35.00 
45.50 
6.50 
7.25 

16.50 
37.00 
60.00 
470.00 
26.00 
26.00 
45.00 
20.25 
13.50 

.75 
9.75 
13.20 
7.60 

16.75 
26.00 

185.00 
52.50 
196.00 
92.00 
14.00 
21.00 
25.00 
75.00 
225.00 
40.00 
80.00 
2.75 

45.00 

Hall Industries 

19.00 
1.25 
5.25 

95.00 
26.00 
120.00 
105.50 
175.00 
125.00 
58.00 
27.90 
205.00 
29.00 
22.00 
35.00 
27.00 
69.00 
55.00 
162.00 
18.00 
35.00 
55.00 

405.00 
23.00 
24.00 
39.00 
15.75 
18.50 
1.80 
3.60 

13.00 
3.80 

14.00 
49.00 
190.00 
145.00 
180.00 
65.00 
Ii.00 
9.50 
9.00 

56.50 
185.00 
35.00 
75.00 
2.40 

39.90 

United Knitting 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
17.03 

No Bid 
No Bid 

3.87 
5.09 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
23.45 
23.45 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

7.89 
No Bid 

7.69 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

4.82 
No Bid 
22.46 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
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Item 
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112 
114 
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119 
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123 
124 
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149 
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154 

WABCO 

2.25 
535.00 
70.00 
12.00 
12.00 
26.00 
29.00 
285.00 
76.00 
28.00 
7.25 
2.25 
44.00 
66.50 
8.50 
55.00 
27.50 
7.00 
4.85 
2.85 

40.00 
86.50 
43.25 
2.60 

65.00 
40.75 
8.20 
82.00 
67.00 
28.00 

197.25 
31.00 
98.30 
29.50 
52.00 
35.50 

282.50 
173.25 
34.00 
75.75 
45.70 
48.40 
4.05 
66.00 
9.50 
9.75 
9.25 
68.50 

Hall Industries 

1.95 
488.00 
64.00 
18.00 
18.00 
38.00 
24.90 

290.00 
180.00 
24.75 
12.00 
9.90 

48.00 
59.50 
8.00 
39.90 
24.50 
6.25 
4.50 
2.50 

35.00 
79.00 
36.50 
2.20 

59.00 
34.50 
7.30 

74.00 
62.50 
26.40 

220.00 
24.50 
59.00 
17.00 
29.00 
24.00 

210.00 
75.00 
89.00 
54.00 
28.50 
19.50 
3.25 
19.00 
8.25 
7.50 
5.90 

29.80 

United Knitting 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
21.20 

No Bid 
17.23 
27.74 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
15.14 
6.17 
18.70 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
35.25 


